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The first installment of a sexy series about a modern-day heroine writing historical novels based on her
romantic misadventures with the Bad Boy Billionaire.

Jane Sparks has accidentally announced her engagement on Facebook—to the infamous Bad Boy Billionaire,
Duke Austen. As soon as it's discovered that Jane and Duke barely know each other (one hot kiss at a party
does not a relationship make), she'll be completely humiliated. And then Duke does something Jane never
expected: He plays along with her charade.

With his hard-partying playboy reputation jeopardizing a 150-million-dollar investment deal, Duke realizes
an engagement with the sexy but oh-so-proper librarian could be just the thing to repair his reputation. This
good girl tempts him to be very wicked … but only with her. It's unprecedented. Inconceivable. Totally
alluring.

As the unlikely match of librarian and tech entrepreneur set out to convince the world—and the
internet—that their love is real, something unexpected happens: They start falling for each other. But Jane is
secretly writing a historical romance novel that could expose their carefully constructed romance … unless
two perfect strangers are content to be perfectly scandalous together.
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From reader reviews:

Janet Smith:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this The Bad Boy
Billionaire's Wicked Arrangement (Wallflower Trilogy Book 1) book as beginner and daily reading
publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Lou Morton:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what
kind of book you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education books but if you want
experience happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual The Bad
Boy Billionaire's Wicked Arrangement (Wallflower Trilogy Book 1) is kind of guide which is giving the
reader unforeseen experience.

Gary Stark:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes reading, not
only science book but in addition novel and The Bad Boy Billionaire's Wicked Arrangement (Wallflower
Trilogy Book 1) as well as others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly
amazing a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In other case, beside science
book, any other book likes The Bad Boy Billionaire's Wicked Arrangement (Wallflower Trilogy Book 1) to
make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Katie Mueller:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know
that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is The Bad Boy
Billionaire's Wicked Arrangement (Wallflower Trilogy Book 1).
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