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The 2015 Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide is your hassle-free passport to energetic and booming
Bentonville, the very heart of Northwest Arkansas and the headquarters for big box giants, Walmart and
Sam’s Wholesale.

The guide shows you what to see and do from its breathtaking Crystal Bridges museum with its spectacular
grounds and scenic trails, to its top-rated restaurants with award-winning chefs who daily create some of the
best food in the world, to its accommodations that suit every budget including the new 21c Bentonville
Museum Hotel (#1 Rated Hot New Hotel in the U.S.).

Your travel companion takes you to the very soul of this bustling city in the scenic Ozark Mountains where
you can shop exclusive specialty shops and trend setting boutiques the likes of which are usually only seen in
large cities like NYC, Chicago and LA.

 Inside This Visitor Guide:

Crystal Bridges Museum of American Art - a world-class, awe-inspiring museum nestled in the stunning
natural beauty of the hills, trails and streams of the Ozarks. All are welcome to experience the ongoing story
of America as told through the works of her beloved artists. The museum is engaged in collecting and
exhibiting outstanding art that spotlights our evolving American heritage. Due to the generosity of Wal-Mart,
General Admission is free.

Bentonville Film Festival - The unprecedented festival champions women and diversity in film and is
sponsored by some of the largest corporations in America including Coca Cola and Walmart. This is the first
and only film competition in Arkansas and the world, for that matter, to offer digital and retail home
entertainment distribution for its winners.

The Walmart Visitors Center Museum - housed in an original store front interactive setting. Experience
the history of Walmart and its founding family including Helen, Bud and Sam Walton. It's located right on
Bentonville's historic downtown square where you can visit the Saturday Farmer's Market, dine at one of the
award winning restaurants, relax amid a scenic atmosphere of yesteryear and catch one of the many special
events offered on the Downtown Square.

WalMart Headquarters – Where any company that wants to sell products via WalMart or Sam’s Wholesale
must meet with officials at the WalMart Headquarters

Discerning Recommendations - Gives savvy advice from a native author on eateries, lodging, and things to
do. saves you time and money and helps you get the most from your stay in the area

Fun-filled itineraries show you the easiest way to personalize your trip to your own particular interests

Insider tips that are money saving, and help you get around like a native



What the locals say - honest reviews on nearly everything including restaurants, lodging, things to do,
nightlife, shopping, and little-known places that many most travel companions miss

21c Museum Hotel - within a short walk to Crystal Bridges Museum of American Art and on the northeast
corner of the Downtown Square is the beautiful 21c Museum Hotel. Visitors and local citizens alike can
enjoy rotating exhibits, participate in ongoing programs and experience culinary creations to tempt their taste
buds.

Author: Written and researched by Lynn West, a Bentonville native.
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For a visitor guide that covers ALL The Cities of Northwest Arkansas, be sure an check out the NWA
Travel Guide (Includes Bentonville, Eureka Springs, Fayetteville, Rogers, Springdale, Siloam Springs)
available via Kindle and Paperback.

 Download The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/B ...pdf

 Read Online The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville ...pdf

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B00MI6ZWNO


Download and Read Free Online The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista Lynn
West

From reader reviews:

Lois Cox:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed The Northwest
Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You understand
beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree
with it is opinion or you have various other opinion?

Annie Hendricks:

This The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista book is simply not ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is actually
information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. This The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista without we
understand teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being
worry The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista can bring any time you are and not
make your tote space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even cell
phone. This The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista having good arrangement in
word along with layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

George Hinnenkamp:

This The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista are reliable for you who want to
become a successful person, why. The reason why of this The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide:
Bentonville/Bella Vista can be one of the great books you must have is giving you more than just simple
reading through food but feed you with information that might be will shock your previous knowledge. This
book is definitely handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-
book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Northwest Arkansas Travel Guide: Bentonville/Bella Vista
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical
thinking that could it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Harriet White:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know
that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book.
Different categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this The Northwest
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