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In A Discontented Diaspora, Jeffrey Lesser investigates broad questions of ethnicity, the nature of diasporic
identity, and Brazilian culture. He does so by exploring particular experiences of young Japanese Brazilians
who came of age in São Paulo during the 1960s and 1970s, an intensely authoritarian period of military rule.
The most populous city in Brazil, São Paulo was also the world’s largest “Japanese” city outside of Japan by
1960. Believing that their own regional identity should be the national one, residents of São Paulo constantly
discussed the relationship between Brazilianness and Japaneseness. As second-generation Nikkei (Brazilians
of Japanese descent) moved from the agricultural countryside of their immigrant parents into various urban
professions, they became the “best Brazilians” in terms of their ability to modernize the country and the
“worst Brazilians” because they were believed to be the least likely to fulfill the cultural dream of whitening.
Lesser analyzes how Nikkei both resisted and conformed to others’ perceptions of their identity as they
struggled to define and claim their own ethnicity within São Paulo during the military dictatorship.

Lesser draws on a wide range of sources, including films, oral histories, wanted posters, advertisements,
newspapers, photographs, police reports, government records, and diplomatic correspondence. He focuses on
two particular cultural arenas—erotic cinema and political militancy—which highlight the ways that
Japanese Brazilians imagined themselves to be Brazilian. As he explains, young Nikkei were sure that their
participation in these two realms would be recognized for its Brazilianness. They were mistaken. Whether
joining banned political movements, training as guerrilla fighters, or acting in erotic films, the subjects of A
Discontented Diaspora militantly asserted their Brazilianness only to find that doing so reinforced their
minority status.
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From reader reviews:

Cortney Roller:

The book A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese Brazilians and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy, 1960–1980
can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like
a book A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese Brazilians and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy, 1960–1980? A
few of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It
is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or information that you take for
that, you can give for each other; you can share all of these. Book A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese
Brazilians and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy, 1960–1980 has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it
has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is
very wonderful.

Nora Carter:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
wide range of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular book
you have read is A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese Brazilians and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy,
1960–1980.

Lisa Maurer:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition info. Even you love A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese Brazilians
and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy, 1960–1980, you may enjoy both. It is good combination right, you
still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still
don't get it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Norman Ross:

Beside this specific A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese Brazilians and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy,
1960–1980 in your phone, it can give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or details. The
information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so don't always be worry if you feel
like an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have A Discontented Diaspora: Japanese
Brazilians and the Meanings of Ethnic Militancy, 1960–1980 because this book offers for you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not end



up to happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, such as
treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this book along with read it from right
now!
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