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Acrylic Made Easy is a new dynamic technique and project-driven series devoted to introducing beginning
and intermediate artists to the fun and engaging world of acrylic painting. With a fresh and simple approach,
this debut title, Getting Started, teaches artists everything they need to know about working with acrylic
paint. Beginning with an overview on a variety of tools and materials, artists will learn how to select the right
brushes, palettes, paints, paper, and surfaces for their work. This introductory guide also covers various
acrylic gels and mediums and how to use them with acrylic paint to achieve various effects. Getting Started
also provides artists with an overview of basic color theory and how to mix colors effectively, plan a
composition, and achieve proper perspective. Additionally, fine artists will learn a range of basic painting
techniques, such as creating washes, drybrushing, stippling, scumbling, and more. Expert artist Patti Mollica
provides tips and techniques for creating an array of textures, building up layers, and adding details. Through
a collection of approachable step-by-step projects artists will be able to put their newfound acrylic skills to
use, starting with initial sketches and culminating in final works of art. Subject matter ranges from
landscapes, to still life, to portraits, and more. Covering a wide range of content, subject matter, and
techniques, for beginning and intermediate artists alike will find Getting Started a valuable resource for their
art library. With inspiration, instruction, and professional tips and tricks on virtually every page, this full-
color book is the perfect resource for acrylic artists.
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From reader reviews:

Ricardo Boddie:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How many
people to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Studying a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specially this Getting Started:
Master the basic theories and techniques of painting in acrylic (Acrylic Made Easy) book as this book offers
you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no
doubt in it you may already know.

Michael Hollinger:

Getting Started: Master the basic theories and techniques of painting in acrylic (Acrylic Made Easy) can be
one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this guide has
good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into joy
arrangement in writing Getting Started: Master the basic theories and techniques of painting in acrylic
(Acrylic Made Easy) although doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn you into new stage
of crucial considering.

Henrietta Belcher:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to
you is Getting Started: Master the basic theories and techniques of painting in acrylic (Acrylic Made Easy)
this reserve consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This kind of book was
represented how do the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy
to understand. The writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book ideal all
of you.

Susan Arnold:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Getting Started: Master
the basic theories and techniques of painting in acrylic (Acrylic Made Easy) which is getting the e-book



version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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