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This volume of selected academic papers demonstrates the significance of the contribution to mathematics
made by Manfredo P. do Carmo. Twice a Guggenheim Fellow and the winner of many prestigious national
and international awards, the professor at the institute of Pure and Applied Mathematics in Rio de Janeiro is
well known as the author of influential textbooks such as Differential Geometry of Curves and Surfaces. The
area of differential geometry is the main focus of this selection, though it also contains do Carmo's own
commentaries on his life as a scientist as well as assessment of the impact of his researches and a complete
list of his publications. Aspects covered in the featured papers include relations between curvature and
topology, convexity and rigidity, minimal surfaces, and conformal immersions, among others. Offering more
than just a retrospective focus, the volume deals with subjects of current interest to researchers, including a
paper co-authored with Frank Warner on the convexity of hypersurfaces in space forms. It also presents the
basic stability results for minimal surfaces in the Euclidean space obtained by the author and his
collaborators. Edited by do Carmo's first student, now a celebrated academic in her own right, this collection
pays tribute to one of the most distinguished mathematicians.
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From reader reviews:

Charlie Bowers:

In other case, little folks like to read book Manfredo P. do Carmo - Selected Papers. You can choose the best
book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a new book Manfredo P. do
Carmo - Selected Papers. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by way of a book.
Absolutely right, since from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or
abroad you can be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we
can open a book or perhaps searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel
fed up to go to the library. Let's examine.

Johnnie Santiago:

What do you concerning book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
really need something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster.
And you have extra time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should
answer that question since just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each
person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on guardería until university need this kind of Manfredo P.
do Carmo - Selected Papers to read.

Ollie Waymire:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill
your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the book untitled Manfredo P. do Carmo - Selected Papers can be excellent book to read. May
be it may be best activity to you.

George Hoffman:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the
books in the top checklist in your reading list is Manfredo P. do Carmo - Selected Papers. This book that is
certainly qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way
up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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