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In the years after the end of the First World War, large numbers of Africans and African Americans
emigrated to the cities of Europe in search of work and improved social conditions. Their impact on white
European society was immense. In Paris, where the artistic climate was particularly sensitive and
experimental, avant garde artists courted black personalities such as Josephine Baker, Henry Crowder, and
Langston Hughes for their sense of style, vitality, and "otherness". Leger, Picasso, Brancusi, Man Ray,
Giacometti, Sonia Delaunay, and others enthusiastically collected African sculptures and wore tribal jewelry
and clothes. More importantly, they adopted black forms in their work, and their style soon influenced a
larger audience anxious to be in vogue. A passion for black culture swept through Paris, and by the end of
the 1920s, black forms that had provided the initial spark to the modernist vision had become the
commercially successful Art Deco style.

Negrophilia, from the French negrophilie -- the contemporary term to describe the craze -- examines this
commingling of black and white cultures in jazz-age Paris. Painting, sculpture, photography, popular music,
dance, theater, literature, journalism, furniture design, fashion, and advertising -- all are scrutinized to show
how black forms were appropriated, adapted, and popularized by white artists. The photographs, writings,
and memorabilia of poet Guillaume Apollinaire, art collectors Paul Guillaume and Albert Barnes, shipping
heiress and publisher Nancy Cunard, and Surrealists Michel Leiris and Georges Bataille help to recreate the
contemporary atmosphere. The book raises questions about the avantgarde's motives, and suggestsreasons
and meaning for its interest.
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Levy:

The book Negrophilia: Avant-Garde Paris and Black Culture in the 1920s (Interplay) give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book
can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with the subject. If you can
make studying a book Negrophilia: Avant-Garde Paris and Black Culture in the 1920s (Interplay) to be your
habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about a
number of or all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a e-book Negrophilia:
Avant-Garde Paris and Black Culture in the 1920s (Interplay). Kinds of book are several. It means that,
science book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Coleman Jones:

Often the book Negrophilia: Avant-Garde Paris and Black Culture in the 1920s (Interplay) will bring
someone to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique.
When you try to find new book to study, this book very suited to you. The book Negrophilia: Avant-Garde
Paris and Black Culture in the 1920s (Interplay) is much recommended to you you just read. You can also
get the e-book from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

James Jones:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or their
own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the book untitled Negrophilia: Avant-Garde Paris and Black Culture in the 1920s
(Interplay) can be very good book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Harrison Bowman:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Negrophilia: Avant-Garde Paris and Black
Culture in the 1920s (Interplay) can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of
date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books
have than the others?
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