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Based on some of the most interesting research of the last ten years, this book discusses effective practice in
work with persistent young offenders. It contrasts two major evaluations of projects for juvenile offenders,
one of which was successful and the other less so. The projects, Freagarrach and CueTen, were funded by
The Scottish Office and the Scottish Executive. Freagarrach was evaluated over five years from 1995 and
CueTen over three years (its entire lifespan) from 1996. This book makes the findings of these projects
available to a wider readership, setting them in a wider discursive framework than is appropriate in a
government report.

The authors identify the factors that made Freagarrach a more successful project than CueTen, arguing that
an understanding of these factors is important in drawing general conclusions from the experience of the two
projects, and that this is particularly the case because some of these factors have received little attention in
recent discussions of 'what works' in community-based programmes for offenders.

This is a detailed and thorough study of work with juvenile offenders, which will be of particular value to
those interested in less punitive approaches. It will be of interest both to practitioners and to academics in
criminology, social policy and social work.
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From reader reviews:

James Goodman:

The book Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two Projects (Welfare and Society) give you a
sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable much more increase. Book
can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with the subject. If you can
make studying a book Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two Projects (Welfare and Society) to
be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about many or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like start and read a reserve
Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two Projects (Welfare and Society). Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this
guide?

Leonard Palmer:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if
you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly feel happy read one having
theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two
Projects (Welfare and Society) is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

William McDowell:

The book Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two Projects (Welfare and Society) has a lot of
knowledge on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the
very famous author. This articles author makes some research previous to write this book. That book very
easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this article book.

Debra Palacios:

Beside this kind of Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two Projects (Welfare and Society) in
your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the
knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an aged
people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Persistent Young Offenders: An Evaluation of Two
Projects (Welfare and Society) because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you
sometimes have book but you don't get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that wil happen if you
have this within your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring
beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it? Find this book as well as read it from now!
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