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Wanda M. Corn's long-awaited new book proposes a remarkable revisioning of the history of American
modern art between the two world wars. Moving away from issues of style and abstraction, she bases her
work on a broad examination of culture and on discourses of national identity. Corn argues that the key
questions for interwar modernists in New York and Paris were whether or not it was possible to create an art
that was both American and modern, and if it was, what such an art would look like. Both European and
American artists debated these questions and made art that responded to them.

Corn organizes each chapter around a careful reading of a work of art, probing first its peculiar poetry and
style and then its connection to its artist and the cultural influences surrounding it. The result is an unfolding
of the work's contingent relationships with history, literature, art criticism, music, and popular culture. The
works she examines—from those made by the Stieglitz circle to those by European Dadaists—were part of
the quest for "the Great American Thing," a quest that was international in scope and that inspired a decade
of vibrant cultural exchange between the art capitals of Europe and New York.

Passionate and eminently readable, with more than 300 illustrations—drawings, paintings, sculptures,
advertisements, cartoons, and documentary photographs—The Great American Thing indelibly alters the
way we think about the first decades of American modernism and the legacy it created.
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From reader reviews:

Federico Crouch:

The book The Great American Thing: Modern Art and National Identity, 1915-1935 can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave
a very important thing like a book The Great American Thing: Modern Art and National Identity, 1915-
1935? A number of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can give many data for
us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for
that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book The Great American Thing:
Modern Art and National Identity, 1915-1935 has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Dan Hanner:

Exactly why? Because this The Great American Thing: Modern Art and National Identity, 1915-1935 is an
unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will surprise you with the
secret the idea inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such
wonderful way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This
amazing book will give you a lot of gains than the other book possess such as help improving your expertise
and your critical thinking way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the
e-book store hurriedly.

Katherine Khan:

Beside this The Great American Thing: Modern Art and National Identity, 1915-1935 in your phone, it could
possibly give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you
will got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in
narrow small town. It is good thing to have The Great American Thing: Modern Art and National Identity,
1915-1935 because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you oftentimes have book
but you don't get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this inside your hand.
The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to
miss it? Find this book as well as read it from currently!

Regina Hash:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more important than other.
Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time almost no but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the books in
the top record in your reading list is The Great American Thing: Modern Art and National Identity, 1915-
1935. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person.
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