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In June 1876 the 7th U.S. Cavalry was savagely defeated at the Little Bighorn in the Montana wilderness
during an attempt to seize Sioux and Cheyenne hunting grounds. Three years later redcoats mirrored this
utter disaster with an equally high-handed grab for Zulu lands in South Africa.

Lieutenant Colonel George A. Custer and Lieutenant Colonel Anthony W. Durnford had much in common,
from modes of dress to the way they died. This book interweaves the stories of the two soldiers and their
final battles, revealing how, to an astonishing degree, similar personalities, aims, tactics, weapons, stupidity
and a gross underestimation of the powers of the native people led to calamitous defeat.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Robin:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get great deal
of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read will be Custer and the Sioux, Durnford and the Zulus: Parallels in the American and British Defeats at
the Little Bighorn (1876) and Isandlwana (1879).

Alan Levin:

On this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more precious than other.
Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top collection in your reading list is actually Custer and the Sioux, Durnford and the Zulus: Parallels in the
American and British Defeats at the Little Bighorn (1876) and Isandlwana (1879). This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking upwards and
review this book you can get many advantages.

Lucinda Brown:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we
know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to
around the world. Through the book Custer and the Sioux, Durnford and the Zulus: Parallels in the American
and British Defeats at the Little Bighorn (1876) and Isandlwana (1879) we can have more advantage. Don't
that you be creative people? To be creative person must prefer to read a book. Just simply choose the best
book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book Custer and the Sioux,
Durnford and the Zulus: Parallels in the American and British Defeats at the Little Bighorn (1876) and
Isandlwana (1879). You can more attractive than now.

Frank Wimmer:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of news. Within
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just trying to find the Custer and the Sioux, Durnford and the Zulus: Parallels in the American and



British Defeats at the Little Bighorn (1876) and Isandlwana (1879) when you needed it?
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