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An oversized, limited commemorative edition of acclaimed South Florida author Les Standiford’s gripping
true account of the extraordinary construction and spectacular demise of the Key West extension of Henry
Flagler’s Florida East Coast Railway, originally published in 2002 and now in its 20th printing. This edition,
commemorating the completion of the Over-Sea Railroad, January 22, 1912, includes a linen cloth cover,
special heavy stock, silver foil stamping, a double gatefold, a hand-tipped map, and 150 new and vintage
photographs and illustrations. Curators and historians at the Library of Congress, the Monroe County Library
in Key West, and at the Flagler Museum in Palm Beach assisted Creative Director Petra Mason with image
sourcing, as did staff at The Cooper-Hewitt Museum, New York. Many of the images in this edition have
never been published before. A Books & Books Press production in association with Motherland Miami and
The Henry Morrison Flagler Museum, Palm Beach, Florida. 328 pages10 ½ x 8 ½ 150 illustrations HC ISBN
978-0-9839378-0-7$60.00 (Author)
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Frederick:

The book THE LAST TRAIN TO PARADISE Henry Flagler and the Spectacular Rise and Fall of the
Railroad That Changed an Ocean give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to
make your capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting tension or
having big problem together with your subject. If you can make looking at a book THE LAST TRAIN TO
PARADISE Henry Flagler and the Spectacular Rise and Fall of the Railroad That Changed an Ocean to get
your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge
about several or all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a book THE LAST
TRAIN TO PARADISE Henry Flagler and the Spectacular Rise and Fall of the Railroad That Changed an
Ocean. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do
you think about this book?

Charles Powers:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the world,
what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person has different
personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't desire do
that. You must know how great and important the book THE LAST TRAIN TO PARADISE Henry Flagler
and the Spectacular Rise and Fall of the Railroad That Changed an Ocean. All type of book would you see
on many resources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Lisa Robinson:

The book with title THE LAST TRAIN TO PARADISE Henry Flagler and the Spectacular Rise and Fall of
the Railroad That Changed an Ocean has lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help
after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book in your
smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Rose Heck:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in addition to can't
see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this THE LAST TRAIN TO PARADISE Henry Flagler and the Spectacular Rise and Fall of the



Railroad That Changed an Ocean can make you really feel more interested to read.
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