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Russell Bricklin “Bric” Whal is the guy that every Key West local knows and every tourist wants to be.
Relaxed, tanned by island sun and comfortable in his skin, he slides onto a barstool next to you at Schooner
Wharf and lets you buy him a beer. Ex-Navy Seal, Key West native and full time treasure diver, Bric has
been searching for a fortune in gold and silver in the Florida Keys his whole life. Today he may have found
it, but not the treasure he expected. Diving on a sunken Spanish Galleon, he finds three massive gold bars,
not from the wreck that sunk in 1733, but apparently from the Civil War. Bric thinks he’s finally unearthed
his fortune. Or has he?
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From reader reviews:

Edna Garza:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is
usually Treasure Key: Too Close to Key West, Too Far From Reality.

Michael Kelly:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Treasure Key: Too Close to Key
West, Too Far From Reality, you are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to
miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it,
oh come on its named reading friends.

George Hoffman:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must
do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several books
in the top record in your reading list is actually Treasure Key: Too Close to Key West, Too Far From
Reality. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By
looking upward and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Jessica Seymore:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is prepared or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. On this modern
era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the
Treasure Key: Too Close to Key West, Too Far From Reality when you essential it?
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