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40 easy-to-sew projects from the creative talent of Cabbages & Roses, the vintage-style fabric company, that
will transform your home into a pure and pretty tableau of handcrafted detail.

If you long to give your rooms a vintage air and country-cottage appeal, you will love the retro floral prints
and timeless designs of Home-made Vintage, your perfect guide to creating a handmade, easy elegance in
your home. The book offers simple-sew projects to transform every room into the romantic retreat you ve
always wanted. In this step-by-step guide, Christina Strutt shows readers how to make a wealth of projects
for the kitchen and bathroom, conservatory and bedroom and for giving as gifts as well. A skilled stylist and
designer, Christina reveals how to create a look that is personal and unique, but not at all laborintensive.
Reusing old fabrics and accessories in new ways allows the vintage and modern to mingle beautifully and
also saves money and time. The charming projects highlighted in this delightful illustrated book include crisp
linen chair covers, a chic fabric headboard, pretty flower aprons, dreamy voile bed curtains, and soothing
scented herbal pillows.
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From reader reviews:

Melissa Wilcox:

Often the book Home-Made Vintage has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot
of help. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some research just before
write this book. This particular book very easy to read you will get the point easily after perusing this book.

Beatrice Rogers:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they will
get large amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time,
we will say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again,
what kind of activity have you got when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer may
unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your
spare time, the book you have read is actually Home-Made Vintage.

Avis Marguez:

Beside this Home-Made Vintage in your phone, it could give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge
or data. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Home-
Made Vintage because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you often have book but
you would not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in your
hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still
want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from right now!

Jessica Harris:

This Home-Made Vintage is brand-new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information mainly
because it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Home-Made Vintage can be the light
food to suit your needs because the information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These
books acquire itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book type. People who
think that in e-book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is not any in
reading a reserve especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't
miss this! Just read this e-book variety for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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