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Examination Thesis from the year 2010 in the subject American Studies - Literature, grade: 1,0, University
of Marburg, language: English, abstract: Nathaniel Hawthorne is one of America's most noted and highly
praised writers, and a key figure of US literature. His works have contributed to the national identity and can
be found in almost any curriculum of North American Literature Studies worldwide. Being a direct
descendant of Massachusetts Bay colonists, the Puritan era of 17th and 18th century New England served as
a lifelong preoccupation for Hawthorne and inspired many of his best-known stories. Hence, in order to
understand the author and his works, it is crucial to apprehend the historical background from which they
arose. Awareness of both the Puritan legacy in Hawthorne's time and their Calvinist beliefs, which
contributed to the establishment of American identity, serves as a basis for fathoming the intention behind
Hawthorne's writings. His forefathers' concept of wilderness was an important part of their religious life, and
in many of Hawthorne's tales, nature can be perceived as an active agent for both plot and moral message.
Therefore, it is indispensable to consider the development behind the Puritan perception as well as the
prevailing opinion on nature during the writer's lifetime. Seclusion, nature, and Puritanism are constantly
recurring topics in both the author's life and works, wherefore particular attention is paid to these. To be
familiar with Hawthorne's relation to nature, his ancestors, and religion in general is essential in order to
understand the vast amount of symbols that can be found in his stories. The second part of this paper
analyzes two of the author's most eminent and esteemed works according to the use of nature symbolism and
the underlying moral intention. By depicting various images within "Young Goodman Brown" and The
Scarlet Letter, the author examines to which extent they correspond to historical facts and Hawthorne's e
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From reader reviews:

Helen Woodyard:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book A Forest Walk - The Concept of Nature in
Hawthorne's Young Goodman Brown and the Scarlet Letter will make you to be smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think that will open or reading some
sort of book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you seeking
best book or suitable book with you?

Kenneth Poor:

The book A Forest Walk - The Concept of Nature in Hawthorne's Young Goodman Brown and the Scarlet
Letter can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why
must we leave a very important thing like a book A Forest Walk - The Concept of Nature in Hawthorne's
Young Goodman Brown and the Scarlet Letter? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one
aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using your
book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other; you are able to share all of
these. Book A Forest Walk - The Concept of Nature in Hawthorne's Young Goodman Brown and the Scarlet
Letter has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the
enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Robert Mills:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make you
to definitely understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for your requirements is A Forest Walk - The Concept of Nature in Hawthorne's Young
Goodman Brown and the Scarlet Letter this guide consist a lot of the information in the condition of this
world now. This specific book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that
writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this
book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Jack Rolfes:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt that when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book A Forest Walk - The Concept of Nature
in Hawthorne's Young Goodman Brown and the Scarlet Letter to make your reading is interesting. Your
personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book



to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the feeling about book and reading especially. It is to be first
opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the e-book A Forest Walk - The Concept of
Nature in Hawthorne's Young Goodman Brown and the Scarlet Letter can to be a newly purchased friend
when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of the time.
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