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Nulli sua forma manebat. The world of Ovid's Metamorphoses is marked by constant flux in which nothing
keeps its original form. This book argues that Ovid uses the epic simile to capture states of unresolved
identity - in the transition between human, animal and divine identity, as well as in the poem's textual
ambivalence between genres and the negotiation of fiction and reality. In conjuring up a likeness, the mental
image of the simile enters a dialectic of appearances in a visually complex and treacherous universe. Original
and subtle close readings, from Narcissus to Adonis, from Diana's blush to the freeform dreams in the House
of Sleep, trace the simile's potential for exploiting indeterminacy and immateriality. In its protean
permutations the simile touches on the most profound issues of the poem - the nature of humanity and
divinity and the essence of poetic creation.
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From reader reviews:

Gretchen Meehan:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or
something that they don't would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book
Simile and Identity in Ovid's Metamorphoses. All type of book is it possible to see on many solutions. You
can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Kathleen Blackwood:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have
spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question due to the fact just their
can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because start
from on guardería until university need this Simile and Identity in Ovid's Metamorphoses to read.

Cheri Adamo:

The event that you get from Simile and Identity in Ovid's Metamorphoses is a more deep you excavating the
information that hide in the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book
is hard to understand but Simile and Identity in Ovid's Metamorphoses giving you joy feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by means of anyone who read this because
the author of this publication is well-known enough. This book also makes your personal vocabulary
increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We highly recommend you for having this particular Simile and Identity in Ovid's Metamorphoses instantly.

Stephen Lee:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an effort
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer can be Simile and Identity in Ovid's Metamorphoses why because
the wonderful cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you
to pick up this book.
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