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In this short, illuminating and very readable work, Philippe Nemo argues that what we call "the West" is one
and only one cultural entity, to which both North American and Western Europe belong. In contemporary
debates, then, Nemo asserts, it is simply incorrect to exaggerate the differences or gaps between countries
that are indeed "Western."

Brilliantly and succinctly surveying the last five or six millenia, Nemo pieces together the history of the
West’s development. He weaves together political events, philosophical discoveries, religious movements,
and scientific and technological innovations to demonstrate the factors that have influenced and shaped
Western culture. Nemo acknowledges the essential contributions of Greek science and philosophy, Roman
law, Christian thought and modern democratic revolutions to our contemporary liberal democracies.

In his conclusion, Nemo also presents a case for closer geopolitical cooperation among Western societies.

Already translated from the original French into Portuguese, Italian, German and Greek, What is the West?
has received considerable interest throughout Europe; earlier this year, in fact, it received the Italian "Citte
della Rose" prize for essays.

Now available for the first time in English, this book is essential reading for those interested in contemporary
cultural debates on Western culture and nationhood, as well as American values; as well as those interested
in world history and politics, philosophy and religion, and contemporary global politics. Not geared to
specifically conservative or liberal viewpoints but to an accurate rendering of historical ideas and trends,
Nemo’s book should do much to advance our understanding of each other in an increasingly global
community.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Long:

Within other case, little people like to read book What Is the West?. You can choose the best book if you
appreciate reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a book What Is the West?. You
can add information and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because
from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will be known.
About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a book or
perhaps searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel fed up to go to the
library. Let's read.

John McKenzie:

The book What Is the West? can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. So just why must we leave the best thing like a book What Is the West?? A few of you
have a different opinion about guide. But one aim this book can give many information for us. It is
absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you
can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book What Is the West? has simple shape however you
know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by start and read a reserve.
So it is very wonderful.

Guadalupe Ramsey:

Typically the book What Is the West? will bring one to the new experience of reading some sort of book.
The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study, this book very ideal
to you. The book What Is the West? is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book in the
official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

John Jeanbaptiste:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your no
cost time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you
want to try out look for book, may be the e-book untitled What Is the West? can be fine book to read. May be
it might be best activity to you.
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