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This Noble House explores the preoccupation with biblical genealogy that emerged among Jews in the
Islamic Near East between the eleventh and fourteenth centuries. Arnold Franklin looks to Jewish society's
fascination with Davidic ancestry, examining the profusion of claims to the lineage that had already begun to
appear by the year 1000, the attempts to chart the validity of such claims through elaborate genealogical lists,
and the range of meanings that came to be ascribed to the House of David in this period. Jews and Muslims
shared the perception that the Davidic line and the noble family of the Prophet Muhammad were
counterparts to one another, but captivation with Davidic lineage was just one facet of a much broader
Jewish concern with biblical ancestry.

Based on documentary material from the Cairo Geniza, the book argues that this "genealogical turn" should
be understood as a consequence of Jewish society's dynamic encounter with its Arab-Islamic milieu and
constituted a selective adaptation to the importance of ancestry in the dominant cultural environment. While
Jewish society surely had genealogical materials and preoccupations of its own upon which to draw, the
Arab-Islamic regard for tracing the lineage of Muhammad provided the impetus for deploying those
traditions in new and unprecedented ways.

On the one hand, the increased focus on ancestry is an instance of medieval Jews reflexively and
unselfconsciously making use of the cultural forms of their Muslim neighbors; on the other, it is an
expression of cultural competitiveness or even resistance, an implicit response to the claim of Arab
genealogical superiority that uses the very methods of the Arab "science of genealogy." To be sure, Franklin
notes, Jews were only one of several non-Arab minority groups to take up genealogy in this way. At the
broadest level, then, This Noble House illuminates a strategy that various minority populations utilized as
they sought legitimacy within the medieval Arab-Islamic world.
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From reader reviews:

Carmen Flood:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book This Noble House: Jewish Descendants of King David
in the Medieval Islamic East (Jewish Culture and Contexts) will make you to end up being smarter. You can
feel considerably more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that open or
reading a book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you
trying to find best book or acceptable book with you?

Edith Macklin:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book This Noble House: Jewish
Descendants of King David in the Medieval Islamic East (Jewish Culture and Contexts). All type of book is
it possible to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Edward Florez:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book This Noble House: Jewish Descendants of King
David in the Medieval Islamic East (Jewish Culture and Contexts) seemed to be making you to know about
other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book
This Noble House: Jewish Descendants of King David in the Medieval Islamic East (Jewish Culture and
Contexts) is not only giving you much more new information but also to be your friend when you sense
bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with
all the book This Noble House: Jewish Descendants of King David in the Medieval Islamic East (Jewish
Culture and Contexts). You never sense lose out for everything should you read some books.

Adam Mathews:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the This Noble House: Jewish Descendants of King David in the Medieval Islamic East (Jewish
Culture and Contexts) when you required it?
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