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Because new nations need new pasts, they create new ways of commemorating and recasting select historic
events. In Recovered Roots, Yael Zerubavel illuminates this dynamic process by examining the construction
of Israeli national tradition.

In the years leading to the birth of Israel, Zerubavel shows, Zionist settlers in Palestine consciously sought to
rewrite Jewish history by reshaping Jewish memory. Zerubavel focuses on the nationalist reinterpretation of
the defense of Masada against the Romans in 73 C.E. and the Bar Kokhba revolt of 133-135; and on the
transformation of the 1920 defense of a new Jewish settlement in Tel Hai into a national myth. Zerubavel
demonstrates how, in each case, Israeli memory transforms events that ended in death and defeat into heroic
myths and symbols of national revival.

Drawing on a broad range of official and popular sources and original interviews, Zerubavel shows that the
construction of a new national tradition is not necessarily the product of government policy but a creative
collaboration between politicans, writers, and educators. Her discussion of the politics of commemoration
demonstrates how rival groups can turn the past into an arena of conflict as they posit competing
interpretations of history and opposing moral claims on the use of the past. Zerubavel analyzes the
emergence of counter-memories within the reality of Israel's frequent wars, the ensuing debates about the
future of the occupied territories, and the embattled relations with Palestinians.

A fascinating examination of the interplay between history and memory, this book will appeal to historians,
sociologists, anthropologists, political scientists, and folklorists, as well as to scholars of cultural studies,
literature, and communication.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hegarty:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Recovered Roots:
Collective Memory and the Making of Israeli National Tradition. All type of book could you see on many
sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Dirk Sullivan:

The guide untitled Recovered Roots: Collective Memory and the Making of Israeli National Tradition is the
publication that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be
shown to you. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The article writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, hence the information that they
share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Recovered Roots:
Collective Memory and the Making of Israeli National Tradition from the publisher to make you more enjoy
free time.

Sheri Furlong:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Recovered Roots: Collective Memory and the
Making of Israeli National Tradition was vibrant and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
Recovered Roots: Collective Memory and the Making of Israeli National Tradition has many kinds or type.
Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are
the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun
and rest. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading in which.

Elizabeth Branch:

Guide is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By book
Recovered Roots: Collective Memory and the Making of Israeli National Tradition we can get more
advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must choose to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this book
Recovered Roots: Collective Memory and the Making of Israeli National Tradition. You can more appealing
than now.
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