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Savvy advice on making the switch from PCs to Macs--in full color! * Provides switchers with the essential
information they need to make a successful transition to Macs; this guide homes in on the most useful techy
nuggets about Apple and Macs, information that helps readers eliminate hassles and save time while
transitioning* Covers getting started on a Mac; sharing data between a Mac and PC; dual boot and running
Windows applications on a Mac using BootCamp; connecting devices to a Mac; safely transferring important
data such as calendars, contacts, and music; and much more* As with all books in the Portable Genius series,
this book is fun but straightforward; it comes in a handy portable size that doesn't skimp on the essentials and
is packed with tips, cool tricks, and savvy advice Paul McFedries (Toronto, ON, Canada) is a Mac expert and
full-time technical writer. He has written more than 60 books that have sold over three million copies
worldwide. These books include iPhone 3G Portable Genius and Macs Portable Genius. His Web site is
www.mcfedries.com.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Anderson:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't wish do
that. You must know how great as well as important the book Switching to a Mac Portable Genius. All type
of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Stacee Stern:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Switching to a Mac
Portable Genius suitable to you? The book was written by famous writer in this era. Often the book untitled
Switching to a Mac Portable Geniusis the main one of several books that everyone read now. This specific
book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new dimensions
that you ever know before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, so all of people can easily
to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So
that you can see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Mary Moore:

The guide with title Switching to a Mac Portable Genius posesses a lot of information that you can study it.
You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u
to find out how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal
growth. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Regina Hash:

E-book is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. With the
book Switching to a Mac Portable Genius we can get more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people?
To become creative person must choose to read a book. Simply choose the best book that suited with your
aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life by this book Switching to a Mac Portable Genius. You can
more appealing than now.
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